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Good Morning,
 
I’m excited to share that today we announced that the Special Committee of our Board of Directors and Liberty Media have agreed on a transaction that will
result in SiriusXM becoming an independent public company, with no majority stockholder, a single class of shares and a board comprising a majority of
independent directors.
 
As a reminder, in September, Liberty Media approached our Special Committee with a proposal regarding a potential transaction. Over the last several months,
the Special Committee of our Board of Directors, working closely with its independent advisors, evaluated the proposal and negotiated the terms of the
agreements with Liberty Media. Through this transaction, we expect to move forward as a standalone publicly traded company with greater strategic flexibility
and a simplified ownership structure, which we believe will be a catalyst for our next phase of value creation for stockholders. To learn more about this
transaction, I encourage you to read the press release we issued here and tune in to the joint investor conference call and webcast this morning at 8:30 AM ET.
The event can be accessed on the Investor Relations section of our SiriusXM website here, and a replay will be available later.
 
Thanks to your hard work and dedication, we have established SiriusXM as the leading audio entertainment provider in North America in a highly fragmented
industry. We have achieved this by creating an experience centered on our high-quality, premium, human curated radio that is more relevant than ever. In doing
so, we have built a profitable business that is poised for continued success.
 
As we roll out our next generation platform, starting with the launch of our new app this week, we have a tremendous opportunity to build on our strong
foundation and capture more demand for our service, particularly amongst our growth audience segments. This is an incredibly exciting and transformative

 



moment in our history, and the transaction offers the Liberty Media stockholders the opportunity to participate directly in our long-term upside potential.
 
Looking Ahead
 
We expect this transaction to be completed early in the third quarter of 2024, subject to approval by Liberty Media stockholders, as well as regulatory approvals
and other customary closing conditions.
 
Until then – and even after we complete this transaction – it remains business as usual at SiriusXM. Together, we must all stay focused on delivering for our
stockholders and listeners and executing on our vision to shape the future of audio where everyone is effortlessly connected to the voices, stories, and music
they love.
 
I hope you share my excitement for what we can achieve together as part of SiriusXM’s next phase.
 
Thank you for your commitment to SiriusXM, our stockholders, our listeners, and each other.
 
Sincerely,
 
Jennifer
 
Cautionary Note Regarding Forward-Looking Statements
 
This communication includes certain forward-looking statements within the meaning of the Private Securities Litigation Reform Act of 1995, including certain
statements relating to the completion of the proposed transaction, proposed trading of common stock of Liberty Sirius XM Holdings Inc. (“SplitCo”) and other
matters related to such proposed transaction. All statements other than statements of historical fact are “forward-looking statements” for purposes of federal and
state securities la�
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may result in additional strategic and operational risks, which may impact Liberty Media, SplitCo and/or SiriusXM’s risk profiles, which each company may not
be able to mitigate effectively; and other risks and uncertainties detailed in periodic reports that Liberty Media and SiriusXM file with the SEC. These forward-
looking statements speak only as of the date of this communication, and Liberty Media and SiriusXM expressly disclaim any obligation or undertaking to
disseminate any updates or revisions to any forward-looking statement contained herein to reflect any change in Liberty Media’s or SiriusXM’s expectations with
regard thereto or any change in events, conditions or circumstances on which any such statement is based. Please refer to the publicly filed documents of
Liberty Media and SiriusXM, including their most recent Forms 10-K and 10-Q, as such risk factors may be amended, supplemented or superseded from time to
time by other reports Liberty Media or SiriusXM subsequently file with the SEC, for additional information about Liberty Media and SiriusXM and about the risks
and uncertainties related to Liberty Media’s and SiriusXM’s businesses which may affect the statements made in this communication.
 
Additional Information
 
Nothing in this communication shall constitute a solicitation to buy or an offer to sell shares of common stock of Liberty Media, � to sell  f sh tng  triu  tm Fo e l ��o
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